
Aber Investments 
Disclosure 

 
Aber Investments is a registered investment advisor based in Boca Raton, FL.  It may only transact business in those 
states in which the firm is registered or qualifies for an exemption or exclusion from registration requirements.  
Please contact Nancy Aber at (561) 342-1884 to find out if the investment adviser is qualified to provide investment 
advisory services in the state where you reside.  Registration does not imply any specific level of skill or training.   
 
Aber Investments’ registration form ADV Part 2A is provided to all clients and prospective clients.  It discusses 
Aber Investments’ business operations, services, fees and other important information.  
 
Aber Investments does not attempt to furnish personalized investment advice or services through this website.  This 
website is intended to provide you with general information about our services, qualifications, staff and contact 
information.  Any subsequent, direct communication by Aber Investments with a prospective client shall be given 
only after the delivery of Form ADV Part 2A and the execution of an investment advisory contract.  This 
communication shall be with an Aber Investments representative that is either registered or qualifies for an 
exemption or exclusion from registration in the state where the prospective client resides.   
 
Certain portions of the Aber Investments website such as blogs, newsletters, articles, commentaries, etc., may 
contain a discussion of Aber Investments’ and those of other investment and non-investment professionals’ positions 
and/or recommendations as of a specific prior date.  Due to various factors, including changing market conditions, 
such discussion may no longer be reflective of current positions and/or recommendations.  Any reader of the Aber 
Investments website understands and acknowledges that information with respect to blogs, newsletters, articles, 
commentaries, etc., provided by the investment advisor may no longer reflect the opinion of the advisor.  
Information on Aber Investments’ website shall not serve as the receipt of, or a substitute for, personalized advice 
from Aber Investments or from any other investment professional. 
 
This website is not intended to provide investment, tax or legal advice.   
 
At certain places on our website we offer direct access or ‘links’ to other Internet websites.  These sites contain 
information that has been created, published, maintained or otherwise posted by institutions or organizations 
independent of Aber Investments.  Aber Investments does not endorse, approve, certify or control these websites and 
does not assume responsibility for the accuracy, completeness or timeliness of the information located there.  
Visitors to these websites should not use or rely on the information contained therein until consulting with an 
independent finance professional. 


